
No 141 of 2003 published in Gazette 5.6.2003 p 2407 

 1 

South Australia 

Fisheries (Fees) Variation Regulations 2003 
under the Fisheries Act 1982 

 

Contents 
Part 1—Preliminary 
1 Short title 
2 Commencement 
3 Interpretation 
4 Variation provisions 

Part 2—Variation of Fisheries (General) Regulations 2000 (Gazette 
31.8.2000 p 1235) as varied 
5 Variation of Schedule 5—Fees (regulation 27) 

Part 3—Variation of Fisheries (Fish Processors) Regulations 1991 (Gazette 
27.6.1991 p 2172) as varied 
6 Variation of Schedule—Fees 

Part 4—Variation of Scheme of Management (Abalone Fisheries) 
Regulations 1991 (Gazette 27.6.1991 p 2123) as varied 
7 Substitution of regulation 1 

1 Short title 
8 Variation of Schedule 1—Fees 
9 Transitional provision 

Part 5—Variation of Scheme of Management (Blue Crab Fishery) 
Regulations 1998 (Gazette 11.6.1998 p 2519) as varied 
10 Substitution of regulation 1 

1 Short title 
11 Variation of Schedule 2—Fees 
12 Variation of Schedule 4—Transitional provisions 
13 Transitional provision 

Part 6—Variation of Scheme of Management (Lakes and Coorong Fishery) 
Regulations 1991 (Gazette 27.6.1991 p 2178) as varied 
14 Substitution of regulation 1 

1 Short title 
15 Variation of regulation 8—Renewal of licences 
16 Transitional provision 



 
Fisheries (Fees) Variation Regulations 2003 
Contents 

2  

Part 7—Variation of Scheme of Management (Marine Scalefish Fisheries) 
Regulations 1991 (Gazette 27.6.1991 p 2187) as varied 
17 Substitution of regulation 1 

1 Short title 
18 Variation of Schedule 2—Fees 
19 Transitional provision 

Part 8—Variation of Scheme of Management (Miscellaneous Fishery) 
Regulations 2000 (Gazette 31.8.2000 p 1222) as varied 
20 Substitution of regulation 1 

1 Short title 
21 Variation of Schedule 4—Fees 
22 Transitional provision 

Part 9—Variation of Scheme of Management (Prawn Fisheries) 
Regulations 1991 (Gazette 27.6.1991 p 2133) as varied 
23 Substitution of regulation 1 

1 Short title 
24 Variation of Schedule 1—Fish prescribed for prawn fisheries 
25 Variation of Schedule 2—Fees 
26 Transitional provision 

Part 10—Variation of Scheme of Management (River Fishery) 
Regulations 1991 (Gazette 27.6.1991 p 2197) as varied 
27 Substitution of regulation 1 

1 Short title 

Part 11—Variation of Scheme of Management (Rock Lobster Fisheries) 
Regulations 1991 (Gazette 27.6.1991 p 2143) as varied 
28 Substitution of regulation 1 

1 Short title 
29 Variation of Schedule 2—Fees 
30 Transitional provision 
 

Part 1—Preliminary 
1—Short title 

These regulations may be cited as the Fisheries (Fees) Variation Regulations 2003. 

2—Commencement 
 (1) Subject to subregulation (2), these regulations come into operation on the day on 

which they are made. 

 (2) Parts 2 and 3 will come into operation on 1 July 2003. 



 
Fisheries (Fees) Variation Regulations 2003 

Preliminary—Part 1 

 3 

3—Interpretation 
In these regulations— 

 (a) licence period means the period of 12 months commencing on 1 July in any 
year; 

 (b) a reference to the principal regulations is a reference to the regulations 
specified in the heading to the Part in which the reference occurs. 

4—Variation provisions 
In these regulations, a provision under a heading referring to the variation of specified 
regulations varies the regulations so specified. 

Part 2—Variation of Fisheries (General) Regulations 2000 
(Gazette 31.8.2000 p 1235) as varied 

5—Variation of Schedule 5—Fees (regulation 27) 
 (1) Schedule 5, clause 2(a)(ii)—delete "$1 089.00" and substitute: 

$1 331 

 (2) Schedule 5, clause 2(b)—delete "$1 089.00" and substitute: 

$1 331 

 (3) Schedule 5, clause 2(c)—delete "$28 570.00" and substitute: 

$64 334 

 (4) Schedule 5, clause 2(d)—delete "$2 178.00" and substitute: 

$2 657 

Part 3—Variation of Fisheries (Fish Processors) 
Regulations 1991 (Gazette 27.6.1991 p 2172) as varied 

6—Variation of Schedule—Fees 
 (1) Schedule, clause 1(1)(a)—delete $115" and substitute: 

$123 

 (2) Schedule, clause 1(1)(b)—delete "$630" and substitute: 

$674 

 (3) Schedule, clause 1(2)—delete "$860" and substitute: 

$920 

 (4) Schedule, clause 2—delete "$20" and substitute: 

$22 



 
Fisheries (Fees) Variation Regulations 2003 
Part 4—Variation of Scheme of Management (Abalone Fisheries) Regulations 1991 (Gazette 27.6.1991 
p 2123) as varied 

4  

Part 4—Variation of Scheme of Management (Abalone 
Fisheries) Regulations 1991 (Gazette 27.6.1991 p 2123) as 
varied 

7—Substitution of regulation 1 
Regulation 1—delete the regulation and substitute: 

1—Short title 
These regulations may be cited as the Fisheries (Scheme of 
Management—Abalone Fisheries) Regulations 1991. 

8—Variation of Schedule 1—Fees 
 (1) Schedule 1, clause 1(a)(i)—delete "51 810" and substitute: 

$58 695 

 (2) Schedule 1, clause 1(a)(ii)—delete "57 539" and substitute: 

$64 859 

 (3) Schedule 1, clause 1(a)(iii)—delete "51 888" and substitute: 

$59 827 

9—Transitional provision 
 (1) A fee prescribed by Schedule 1 of the principal regulations as varied by this Part 

applies in relation to the licence period commencing after the commencement of these 
regulations. 

 (2) Despite regulation 0, a fee prescribed by Schedule 1 of the principal regulations as in 
force immediately before the commencement of these regulations continues to apply 
in relation to the licence period commencing before the commencement of these 
regulations. 

Part 5—Variation of Scheme of Management (Blue Crab 
Fishery) Regulations 1998 (Gazette 11.6.1998 p 2519) as 
varied 

10—Substitution of regulation 1 
Regulation 1—delete the regulation and substitute: 

1—Short title 
These regulations may be cited as the Fisheries (Scheme of 
Management—Blue Crab Fishery) Regulations 1998. 

11—Variation of Schedule 2—Fees 
 (1) Schedule 2, clause 1(a)(i)—delete "$2 197" and substitute: 

$2 043 



 
Fisheries (Fees) Variation Regulations 2003 

Variation of Scheme of Management (Blue Crab Fishery) Regulations 1998 (Gazette 11.6.1998 p 2519) as 
varied—Part 5 

 5 

 (2) Schedule 2, clause 1(a)—delete "$12.35" wherever occurring and substitute in each 
case: 

$19.79 

12—Variation of Schedule 4—Transitional provisions 
Schedule 4, table—relocate the table so that it follows clause 1 

13—Transitional provision 
 (1) A fee prescribed by Schedule 2 of the principal regulations as varied by this Part 

applies in relation to the licence period commencing after the commencement of these 
regulations. 

 (2) Despite regulation 0, a fee prescribed by Schedule 2 of the principal regulations as in 
force immediately before the commencement of these regulations continues to apply 
in relation to the licence period commencing before the commencement of these 
regulations. 

Part 6—Variation of Scheme of Management (Lakes and 
Coorong Fishery) Regulations 1991 (Gazette 27.6.1991 
p 2178) as varied 

14—Substitution of regulation 1 
Regulation 1—delete the regulation and substitute: 

1—Short title 
These regulations may be cited as the Fisheries (Scheme of 
Management—Lakes and Coorong Fishery) Regulations 1991. 

15—Variation of regulation 8—Renewal of licences 
 (1) Regulation 8(5)(a)(i)—delete "$4 264" and substitute: 

$5 514 

 (2) Regulation 8(5)(a)(ii)—delete "$4 354" and substitute: 

$5 604 

16—Transitional provision 
 (1) A fee prescribed by regulation 8 of the principal regulations as varied by this Part 

applies in relation to the licence period commencing after the commencement of these 
regulations. 

 (2) Despite regulation 0, a fee prescribed by regulation 8 of the principal regulations as in 
force immediately before the commencement of these regulations continues to apply 
in relation to the licence period commencing before the commencement of these 
regulations. 



 
Fisheries (Fees) Variation Regulations 2003 
Part 7—Variation of Scheme of Management (Marine Scalefish Fisheries) Regulations 1991 (Gazette 
27.6.1991 p 2187) as varied 

6  

Part 7—Variation of Scheme of Management (Marine Scalefish 
Fisheries) Regulations 1991 (Gazette 27.6.1991 p 2187) as 
varied 

17—Substitution of regulation 1 
Regulation 1—delete the regulation and substitute: 

1—Short title 
These regulations may be cited as the Fisheries (Scheme of 
Management—Marine Scalefish Fisheries) Regulations 1991. 

18—Variation of Schedule 2—Fees 
 (1) Schedule 2, clause 1(a)—delete "2 404" and substitute: 

$2 811 

 (2) Schedule 2, clause 1(a)—delete "$57.36" and substitute: 

$70.94 

19—Transitional provision 
 (1) A fee prescribed by Schedule 2 of the principal regulations as varied by this Part 

applies in relation to the licence period commencing after the commencement of these 
regulations. 

 (2) Despite regulation 0, a fee prescribed by Schedule 2 of the principal regulations as in 
force immediately before the commencement of these regulations continues to apply 
in relation to the licence period commencing before the commencement of these 
regulations. 

Part 8—Variation of Scheme of Management (Miscellaneous 
Fishery) Regulations 2000 (Gazette 31.8.2000 p 1222) as 
varied 

20—Substitution of regulation 1 
Regulation 1—delete the regulation and substitute: 

1—Short title 
These regulations may be cited as the Fisheries (Scheme of 
Management—Miscellaneous Fishery) Regulations 2000. 

21—Variation of Schedule 4—Fees 
 (1) Schedule 4, clause 1(a)(i)—delete "$2 782" and substitute: 

$2 811 



 
Fisheries (Fees) Variation Regulations 2003 

Variation of Scheme of Management (Miscellaneous Fishery) Regulations 2000 (Gazette 31.8.2000 p 1222) 
as varied—Part 8 

 7 

 (2) Schedule 4, clause 1(a)—delete "$26.67" wherever occurring and substitute in each 
case: 

$29.78 

22—Transitional provision 
 (1) A fee prescribed by Schedule 4 of the principal regulations as varied by this Part 

applies in relation to the licence period commencing after the commencement of these 
regulations. 

 (2) Despite regulation 0, a fee prescribed by Schedule 4 of the principal regulations as in 
force immediately before the commencement of these regulations continues to apply 
in relation to the licence period commencing before the commencement of these 
regulations. 

Part 9—Variation of Scheme of Management (Prawn Fisheries) 
Regulations 1991 (Gazette 27.6.1991 p 2133) as varied 

23—Substitution of regulation 1 
Regulation 1—delete the regulation and substitute: 

1—Short title 
These regulations may be cited as the Fisheries (Scheme of 
Management—Prawn Fisheries) Regulations 1991. 

24—Variation of Schedule 1—Fish prescribed for prawn fisheries 
Schedule 1—delete "The following fish are specified for the prawn fisheries:" 

25—Variation of Schedule 2—Fees 
 (1) Schedule 2, clause 1(a)(i)—delete "27 455" and substitute: 

$25 097 

 (2) Schedule 2, clause 1(a)(ii)—delete "17 193" and substitute: 

$19 316 

 (3) Schedule 2, clause 1(a)(iii)—delete "15 557" and substitute: 

$7 136 

26—Transitional provision 
 (1) A fee prescribed by Schedule 2 of the principal regulations as varied by this Part 

applies in relation to the licence period commencing after the commencement of these 
regulations. 

 (2) Despite regulation 0, a fee prescribed by Schedule 2 of the principal regulations as in 
force immediately before the commencement of these regulations continues to apply 
in relation to the licence period commencing before the commencement of these 
regulations. 



 
Fisheries (Fees) Variation Regulations 2003 
Part 10—Variation of Scheme of Management (River Fishery) Regulations 1991 (Gazette 27.6.1991 p 2197) 
as varied 

8  

Part 10—Variation of Scheme of Management (River Fishery) 
Regulations 1991 (Gazette 27.6.1991 p 2197) as varied 

27—Substitution of regulation 1 
Regulation 1—delete the regulation and substitute: 

1—Short title 
These regulations may be cited as the Fisheries (Scheme of 
Management—River Fishery) Regulations 1991. 

Part 11—Variation of Scheme of Management (Rock Lobster 
Fisheries) Regulations 1991 (Gazette 27.6.1991 p 2143) as 
varied 

28—Substitution of regulation 1 
Regulation 1—delete the regulation and substitute: 

1—Short title 
These regulations may be cited as the Fisheries (Scheme of 
Management—Rock Lobster Fisheries) Regulations 1991. 

29—Variation of Schedule 2—Fees 
 (1) Schedule 2, clause 1(a)(i)—delete "6 628.00" and substitute: 

$13 330 

 (2) Schedule 2, clause 1(a)(ii)—delete "7 108.00" and substitute: 

$13 830 

 (3) Schedule 2, clause 1(a)(iii)—delete "8 310.00" and substitute: 

$14 737 

 (4) Schedule 2, clause 1(a)—delete "$26.67" and substitute: 

$29.78 

 (5) Schedule 2, clause 1(ab)(i)—delete "5 616.00" and substitute: 

$7 640 

 (6) Schedule 2, clause 1(ab)(ii)—delete "6 096.00" and substitute: 

$8 140 

 (7) Schedule 2, clause 1(ab)(iii)—delete "7 298.00" and substitute: 

$9 047 

 (8) Schedule 2, clause 1(ab)—delete "$26.67" and substitute: 

$29.78 



 
Fisheries (Fees) Variation Regulations 2003 

Variation of Scheme of Management (Rock Lobster Fisheries) Regulations 1991 (Gazette 27.6.1991 p 2143) 
as varied—Part 11 

 9 

30—Transitional provision 
 (1) A fee prescribed by Schedule 2 of the principal regulations as varied by this Part 

applies in relation to the licence period commencing after the commencement of these 
regulations. 

 (2) Despite regulation 0, a fee prescribed by Schedule 2 of the principal regulations as in 
force immediately before the commencement of these regulations continues to apply 
in relation to the licence period commencing before the commencement of these 
regulations. 

Note— 

As required by section 10AA(2) of the Subordinate Legislation Act 1978, the Minister has certified 
that, in the Minister's opinion, it is necessary or appropriate that these regulations come into 
operation as set out in these regulations. 

Made by the Governor 
with the advice and consent of the Executive Council 
on 5 June 2003 

No 141 of 2003 
MAFF03/0022CS 


