
No 84 of 2003 published in Gazette 29.5.2003 p 2223 

 1 

South Australia 

Magistrates Court (Fees) Variation Regulations 2003 
under the Magistrates Court Act 1991 

 

Contents 
Part 1—Preliminary 
1 Short title 
2 Commencement 
3 Variation provisions 

Part 2—Variation of Magistrates Court (Fees) Regulations 1992 (Gazette 
2.7.1992 p 232) as varied 
4 Variation of Schedule 1—Fees in Civil (General Claims) Division and Civil (Minor 

Claims) Division 
5 Variation of Schedule 2—Fees in Criminal Division 
 

Part 1—Preliminary 
1—Short title 

These regulations may be cited as the Magistrates Court (Fees) Variation 
Regulations 2003. 

2—Commencement 
These regulations will come into operation on 1 July 2003. 

3—Variation provisions 
In these regulations, a provision under a heading referring to the variation of specified 
regulations varies the regulations so specified. 

Part 2—Variation of Magistrates Court (Fees) Regulations 1992 
(Gazette 2.7.1992 p 232) as varied 

4—Variation of Schedule 1—Fees in Civil (General Claims) Division and Civil 
(Minor Claims) Division 

 (1) Schedule 1, clause 1—delete "$60" and substitute: 

$74 

 (2) Schedule 1, clause 2—delete "$60" and substitute: 

$74 



 
Magistrates Court (Fees) Variation Regulations 2003 
Part 2—Variation of Magistrates Court (Fees) Regulations 1992 (Gazette 2.7.1992 p 232) as varied 

2  

 (3) Schedule 1, clause 3—delete "$115" and substitute: 

$140 

 (4) Schedule 1, clause 4—delete "$115" and substitute: 

$140 

 (5) Schedule 1, clause 5—delete "$10.70" and substitute: 

$11.20 

 (6) Schedule 1, clause 6—delete "$60" and substitute: 

$74 

 (7) Schedule 1, clause 7—delete "$60" and substitute: 

$74 

 (8) Schedule 1, clause 9—delete "$8.80" and substitute: 

$9.20 

 (9) Schedule 1, clause 13—delete "$55" and substitute: 

$57 

 (10) Schedule 1, clause 15—delete "$32" and substitute: 

$33.50 

 (11) Schedule 1, clause 16—delete "$165" and substitute: 

$172 

 (12) Schedule 1, clause 17—delete "$496" and substitute: 

$516 

5—Variation of Schedule 2—Fees in Criminal Division 
 (1) Schedule 2, clause 1—delete "$88" and substitute: 

$104 

 (2) Schedule 2, clause 1—delete "$25.20" and substitute: 

$26.20 

 (3) Schedule 2, clause 1A—delete "$88" and substitute: 

$104 

 (4) Schedule 2, clause 2—delete "$27.50" and substitute: 

$28.50 

 (5) Schedule 2, clause 6—delete "$55" and substitute: 

$57 
Note— 

As required by section 10AA(2) of the Subordinate Legislation Act 1978, the Minister has certified 
that, in the Minister's opinion, it is necessary or appropriate that these regulations come into 
operation as set out in these regulations. 



 
Magistrates Court (Fees) Variation Regulations 2003 

Variation of Magistrates Court (Fees) Regulations 1992 (Gazette 2.7.1992 p 232) as varied—Part 2 

 3 

Made by the Governor 
with the advice and consent of the Executive Council 
on 29 May 2003 

No 84 of 2003 
AGO0073/03CS AGO0114/03CS AGO0116/03CS 


