
No 231 of 2008 published in Gazette 21.8.2008 p 3801 

 1 

South Australia 

Teachers Registration and Standards Variation 
Regulations 2008 
under the Teachers Registration and Standards Act 2004 

 

Contents 
Part 1—Preliminary 
1 Short title 
2 Commencement 
3 Variation provisions 

Part 2—Variation of Teachers Registration and Standards Regulations 2005 
4 Variation of regulation 5—Fees for registration 
5 Variation of regulation 6—Assessment by Teachers Registration Board of qualifications 
6 Variation of regulation 8—Fee to accompany application for special authority for 

unregistered person to teach 
 

Part 1—Preliminary 
1—Short title 

These regulations may be cited as the Teachers Registration and Standards Variation 
Regulations 2008. 

2—Commencement 
These regulations will come into operation on 1 September 2008. 

3—Variation provisions 
In these regulations, a provision under a heading referring to the variation of specified 
regulations varies the regulations so specified. 

Part 2—Variation of Teachers Registration and Standards 
Regulations 2005 

4—Variation of regulation 5—Fees for registration 
 (1) Regulation 5(1)(a)—delete "$180" and substitute: 

$270 

 (2) Regulation 5(1)(b)—delete "$75" and substitute: 

$100 



 
Teachers Registration and Standards Variation Regulations 2008 
Part 2—Variation of Teachers Registration and Standards Regulations 2005 

2  

 (3) Regulation 5(1)(c)—delete "$60" and substitute: 

$90 

 (4) Regulation 5(2)—delete "$180" and substitute: 

$270 

5—Variation of regulation 6—Assessment by Teachers Registration Board of 
qualifications 

Regulation 6(2)(b)—delete "$75" and substitute: 

$100 

6—Variation of regulation 8—Fee to accompany application for special 
authority for unregistered person to teach 

Regulation 8(a)—delete paragraph (a) and substitute: 

 (a) — 

 (i) if the special authority is to be in force for a period of not 
more than 12 months—$90; or 

 (ii) if the special authority is to be in force for a period of more 
than 12 months—an amount of $90 for each 12 month 
period, or part of such period, during which the special 
authority is to be in force; plus 

Note— 

As required by section 10AA(2) of the Subordinate Legislation Act 1978, the Minister has certified 
that, in the Minister's opinion, it is necessary or appropriate that these regulations come into 
operation as set out in these regulations. 

Made by the Governor 
with the advice and consent of the Executive Council 
on 21 August 2008 

No 231 of 2008 
MECS08/012 


