
No 94 of 2015 published in Gazette 18.6.2015 p 2649 

 1 

South Australia 

Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) (Fees) Variation 
Regulations 2015 
under the Road Traffic Act 1961 

 

Contents 
Part 1—Preliminary 
1 Short title 
2 Commencement 
3 Variation provisions 

Part 2—Variation of Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) Regulations 2014 
4 Variation of Schedule 3—Fees 
 

Part 1—Preliminary 
1—Short title 

These regulations may be cited as the Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) (Fees) Variation 
Regulations 2015. 

2—Commencement 
These regulations will come into operation on 1 July 2015. 

3—Variation provisions 
In these regulations, a provision under a heading referring to the variation of specified 
regulations varies the regulations so specified. 

Part 2—Variation of Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) 
Regulations 2014 

4—Variation of Schedule 3—Fees 
 (1) Schedule 3, clause 1(2), table—delete the table and substitute: 

 

 Type of vehicle and inspection Fee 

1. Heavy vehicles and buses  

 (1) Inspection of a motor vehicle (other than a bus) $231 

 (2) Inspection of—  

   (a) a converter dolly $77 

   (b) a trailer other than a converter dolly $155 



 
Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) (Fees) Variation Regulations 2015 
Part 2—Variation of Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) Regulations 2014 

2  

 Type of vehicle and inspection Fee 

 (3) Inspection of a bus $231 

 (4) Further inspection of a vehicle $77 

2. Vehicles other than heavy vehicles or buses  

 (1) Inspection of a vehicle for the purposes of an exemption 
under section 163AA of the Act or regulation 71 

$231 

 (2) Inspection of a vehicle for the purposes of 
section 139(1)(ab)(i) or (ii) or (1)(ac)(ii)(A) or (B) of the 
Motor Vehicles Act 1959 

$231 

 (3) Inspection of LPG-converted vehicle for the purposes of 
the Dangerous Substances Act 1979 

$231 

 (4) Any other inspection of a vehicle $155 

 (5) Further inspection of a vehicle $77 

 (2) Schedule 3, clause 1(4)—delete "$58" and substitute: 

$54 

 (3) Schedule 3, clause 2(2)(a)—delete "$73" and substitute: 

$75 

 (4) Schedule 3, clause 2(2)(b)(i)—delete "$48" and substitute: 

$49 

 (5) Schedule 3, clause 2(2)(b)(ii)—delete "$248" and substitute: 

$254 
Note— 

As required by section 10AA(2) of the Subordinate Legislation Act 1978, the Minister has certified 
that, in the Minister's opinion, it is necessary or appropriate that these regulations come into 
operation as set out in these regulations. 

Made by the Governor 
with the advice and consent of the Executive Council 
on 18 June 2015 

No 94 of 2015 
MTR/15/007 

http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Motor%20Vehicles%20Act%201959
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Dangerous%20Substances%20Act%201979
http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Subordinate%20Legislation%20Act%201978

	Part 1—Preliminary
	1—Short title
	2—Commencement
	3—Variation provisions

	Part 2—Variation of Road Traffic (Miscellaneous) Regulations 2014
	4—Variation of Schedule 3—Fees


