
No 34 of 2023 published in Gazette 18.5.2023 p 977 

 1 

South Australia 

Fines Enforcement and Debt Recovery (Prescribed 
Amounts) Amendment Regulations 2023 
under the Fines Enforcement and Debt Recovery Act 2017 

 

Contents 
Part 1—Preliminary 
1 Short title 
2 Commencement 

Part 2—Amendment of Fines Enforcement and Debt Recovery 
Regulations 2018 
3 Amendment of regulation 6—Amounts unpaid or unrecovered for more than certain 

period (section 14 of Act) 
4 Amendment of regulation 19—Amounts unpaid or unrecovered for more than certain 

period (section 26 of Act) 
 

Part 1—Preliminary 
1—Short title 

These regulations may be cited as the Fines Enforcement and Debt Recovery 
(Prescribed Amounts) Amendment Regulations 2023. 

2—Commencement 
These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2023. 

Part 2—Amendment of Fines Enforcement and Debt Recovery 
Regulations 2018 

3—Amendment of regulation 6—Amounts unpaid or unrecovered for more 
than certain period (section 14 of Act) 

 (1) Regulation 6(1)—delete "$112" and substitute: 

$117 

 (2) Regulation 6(2)—delete "$205" and substitute: 

$215 



 
Fines Enforcement and Debt Recovery (Prescribed Amounts) Amendment Regulations 2023 
Part 2—Amendment of Fines Enforcement and Debt Recovery Regulations 2018 

2  

4—Amendment of regulation 19—Amounts unpaid or unrecovered for more 
than certain period (section 26 of Act) 

 (1) Regulation 19(1)—delete "$112" and substitute: 

$117 

 (2) Regulation 19(2)—delete "$205" and substitute: 

$215 
Editorial note— 

As required by section 10AA(2) of the Legislative Instruments Act 1978, the Minister has certified 
that, in the Minister's opinion, it is necessary or appropriate that these regulations come into 
operation as set out in these regulations. 

Made by the Governor's Deputy 
with the advice and consent of the Executive Council 
on 18 May 2023 

No 34 of 2023 

http://www.legislation.sa.gov.au/index.aspx?action=legref&type=act&legtitle=Legislative%20Instruments%20Act%201978

	Part 1—Preliminary
	1—Short title
	2—Commencement

	Part 2—Amendment of Fines Enforcement and Debt Recovery Regulations 2018
	3—Amendment of regulation 6—Amounts unpaid or unrecovered for more than certain period (section 14 of Act)
	4—Amendment of regulation 19—Amounts unpaid or unrecovered for more than certain period (section 26 of Act)


